
From: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
To: Susie Grant; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Lopez, Andrea
Cc: Michael Kuehn; Gary Shullaw; bellc@gtlaw.com
Subject: RE: PetSmart Home Office, Inc., Docket No. FIFRA-04-2023-0706(b) - Payment of Civil Penalty
Date: Monday, July 17, 2023 8:12:33 PM
Attachments: image002.png

image003.png

Thank you!
 
Shannon L. Richardson
Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC
Paralegal Specialist
General/Criminal Law & Cross-Office Support
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, Atlanta, GA. 30303
Office: 404.562.8929 |
 
From: Susie Grant <SuGrant@PetSmart.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 2:16 PM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Lopez, Andrea <Lopez.Andrea@epa.gov>
Cc: Michael Kuehn <MKuehn@PetSmart.com>; Gary Shullaw <GShullaw@PetSmart.com>; bellc@gtlaw.com
Subject: PetSmart Home Office, Inc., Docket No. FIFRA-04-2023-0706(b) - Payment of Civil Penalty
 
Good Morning,
 
In accordance with the attached Consent Agreement in the above-named matter, please see the wire transfer
confirmation below, representing PetSmart’s payment of the civil penalty in this case.  The payment was wired this
morning.
 
Could you please confirm receipt?  Please let me know if you have any questions, and thank you.
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Commercial Electronic Office (CEO) Portal Wires Alert: Wire Successful (Beneficiary Copy)

Dear Environmental Protection Agency,

‘This vire has been processed successly.

DatefTime Stamp: 0711712023 06:54 am PT
Alert Information
Confirmation Number. FED:07171B7032R007504
Originator Name: PETSMART HOME OFFICE, INC
Originator Address: 19601 N 27TH AVE
Value Date: 071712023
Amount 30,000.00 USD.
Beneficiary Name: Environmental Protection Agency

1f you received this noification in error, please contact the Originator.

AlertID: $198-2434865





PETSMART

Anything for Pets





 
Susie Grant
 

Susie Grant, CEDS | (she/her) Senior Paralegal - Litigation

19601 N. 27th Ave., Phoenix, AZ 85027
office: 623-587-2917 | fax: 623-580-6103
email:  sugrant@petsmart.com
 
This email may contain confidential and privileged material that is legally protected from disclosure.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete this message, let me know that you received this communication in error, and do not use or disclose this
message to others.  Also, please know that any tax advice in this email cannot be used for avoiding penalties under the Internal
Revenue Code or promoting or recommending the potential tax consequences of any matter discussed in this email to others.  This
email and any attachments that are not fully executed by PetSmart do not constitute binding agreements.
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